
TEWIN VILLAGE WEBSITE GROUP     www.tewinvillage.co.uk

DATA PROTECTION POLICY (INCORPORATING GDPR)          

Tewin Village website is for the whole village.  We publish village news and photographs and
list village sports and social events including those held in our Village Hall and Community 
Shop.  Tewin groups use the site as a means of providing information about their activities 
and how others may participate in them.

www.tewinvillage.co.uk contains links to other websites.  The Village Website Group isn’t 
responsible for the privacy policies and practices of other sites.  This policy only applies to 
information collected by www.tewinvillage.co.uk

Tewin based organisations are welcome to be a part of the site and to be represented on the
Village Website Group.

We are the website for Tewin Parish Council and publish their minutes.  We also publish the 
Tewin Magazine in digital format.

Data held on the website may include names, postal addresses, phone numbers and email 
addresses from a range of village sources.  We do not sell information to third parties or 
supply it for commercial gain.

In relation to personal information, when we publish names, email and postal addresses, and
telephone numbers this is done on the understanding that the contributing organisation has 
the consent of the people concerned.  

Some photographs can constitute personal information.  Any photographs published on the 
website will either have been obtained by the photographer with the consent of those being 
photographed or they will have been taken at public events and could have been taken by 
any member of the public.  In the case of photographs of individually identifiable minors the 
photographer will have obtained parent or carer consent.

Tewin Village Website Group is made up of volunteers who maintain the website via their 
home computers.  When members of the public contact us the enquiry will be held 
temporarily on the webmaster’s home computer until it is dealt with, after which it is deleted.

The Tewin Village Website is hosted by Voice online communities  https://e-voice.org.uk/ 
and subject to their operational and technical security procedures.  Voice undertake not to 
share Personal Information with anyone for any purpose without explicit permission.

The Group will consider requests from members of the public to remove photographs or 
data.  
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